To: Mm[ﬁev acation@agmail.com]; Je vacation[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From:
Sent: ri 9/14/2012 11:54:57 PM

Subject: Re: Gll invoice

Yes,,,

I'm heading to Edgewood to purchase fans and gym angle pushup bars.
I'll return approx 8pm to address stereo in living room

Thx

Larry

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation{i@ gmail com>
Date: Fri, 14 Sep 2012 17:52:33 -0600

To:
Subject: Re: Gl nvoice

yes,, also living room now shorting out, poease check when you return

On Fri, Sep 14, 2012 at 5:50 PM, - wrote:

Jeffrey,
Rich and spoke in regards to gulfstream invoice, and asked that | obtain your approval.

You are correct, the rebill regarding the invoice 1 received from Gulfstream 1s normal,

We sent our Spoiler actuators for overhaul-exchange, corrosion was found beyond limits which
required additional parts to both actuators, 516k per unit.

May I have your approval to pay gulfstream the $32k owed?

Thank you
Larry

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T

T P PR e R P LR L L

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeftrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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