To: jeevacation@gmail com[jeevacation@amail.com], Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: drsra

Sent: Tue 7/3/2012 3:40:51 PM

Subject: Fw: Re: [Secure] Re: Dr. Steven Alexander

Looks like we settled the $209,000.00 debt for $75,000.00. It is a funny story how it happened.
Glad to be out from under the various binds Muke Hardman put me in. Frees me to concentrate
on other things again.

Have a good 4th of July.
Steve

--- On Tue, 7/3/12, Trent Steele <trentia frentsteele.com= wrote:

From: Trent Slcclc_
Subject: Re: [Secure] Re: Dr. Steven Alexander
To:'

Date: Tuesday, July 3, 2012, 11:01 AM

Please send account number, and proposed settlement docs. T'll have Dr Alexander wire
funds to you on Monday

Sent from my mobile phone

On Jul 3. 2012 at 8:10 AM. '

WIS

Trent,

Dr. Alexander will need to wire the funds to the following acmunt._

Please have Mr. Alexander include the account number on the
wire so we will know where to post the funds. Do you have the account number? | need
to know when he intends on wiring the funds as well.. 10 business days after the
payment has posted we will release our interest in whatever collateral is attached. We

will also send a settled in full letter for Dr. Alexander's records.

Thanks,

Tiffany C. Stewart
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Daate O7F02r2012 0&:51 AM

= Dr. Steven Alexander

Tiffany,

As we discussed, you have agreed to accept 575,000 in full and final settlement of this claim. Please
advise to whom the check should be issued and who will be preparing the release and
satisfaction. Also, please let me know if you would prefer my client to send the check to you
directly or if you would prefer my client send payment to me and | will forward payment to
you from my trust account,

Trent

The infermation contained in this transmission may be attorneyichient privileged and confidential. It is intended only for the use of
the individual or entity narmed above, If the reader of this message is not the inlended reciplent, you ane hereby notified that any
dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error,
please notify us immediately by reply e-mail
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