To: jeevacation@gmail . com[jeevacation@amail.com]; Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]

From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Fri 11/18/2011 4:19:53 PM

Subject: Re:
On Nov 18,2011, at 11:18 AM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote:

give me her cell phone

On Fri, Nov 18,2011 at 11:18 AM, Lesley Gmﬁ"- wrote:

had me cancel the appt I made for her with Dr Victor on Monday because
she already has an appt to see him on Tues. 22nd...she said she forgot to ask if
she could pick up money for this appt..she says it will be probably $600, but if
you could even give her $500 it would be great.
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