To: jeevacation@gmail com[jesvacation@gmail.com], Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]
Cc:

From: Fichard Kahn
Sent: Mon 3/26/2012 3:54:15 PM
Subject: Re: SLK-Dining Rm

1 just spoke with mare sacco and he believes that the price difference 1s due to his quote being real
silk and taipings being a viscous blend (dull silk) / outside of cacoon

marc asked us to get a detailed quote from taiping in addition to a sample so sacco can have it
tested - marc strongly thinks that there is no way there quote is real silk

sarah can you please give me a contact a taiping that i can call to get this info
thanks

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F
New York, NY 10065

On Mar 26, 2012, at 11:24 AM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote:

it can't be 55k for one rug. for the dining room, he is trying to fuck us

On Mon, Mar 26, 2012 at 5:20 PM— wrote:

Just received this email from Kim at Sacco

Begin forwarded message:

From: Kim Steube
Date: March 26, 2012 5:03:53 PM GMT+02:00

Ce: Rich Kah
Subject: SLK-Dining Rm

Hi Sarah,

| am sorry about the confusion on the 25% payments. This was my

error for not explaining our arrangement with my assistant Bradford.
I have attached the updated price for the dining room and the

remaming credit which mcludes the new dining room rug. Please
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review and let me know if you have any questions.

Rich- if you have any questions on the balance credit amount, please
call me

Thank you,

KIM STEUBE
520 BROADWAY

§TH FLOOR

HEW YORK, NY 10012

W saccocarpet com
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chent privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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