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Just received this email from Kim at Sacco 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Kim Steube 
Date: March 26, 2012 5:03: N1T102:00 
To: Sarah K  
Cc: Rich Kahn
Subject: SLK-Dining Rm 

Hi Sarah, 
I am sorry about the confusion on the 25% payments. This was my error for not 
explaining our arrangement with my assistant Bradford. I have attached the updated 
price for the dining room and the remaining credit which includes the new dining room 
rug. Please review and let me know if you have any questions. 

Rich- if you have any questions on the balance credit amount, please call me. 

Thank you, 

KIM STEUBE 
520 BROADWAY 
6TH FLOOR 
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