To: jeevacation@gmail com[jeevacation@amail.com], Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Rich Kahn

Sent: Wed 3/23/2011 4:44:26 PM

Subject: FW: Flight Options - 1525715 3/27

Rich Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

381 East 66th Street, Suite 18F

New York, NY 18865

From: Brendan Nolan [mailto

Sent: Wednesday, March 23, W

To: Rich Kahn
Subject: RE: Flight Options - 1525715 3/27

Here is a sketch of the pricing
Billed Hours = 2

Hourly Rate = 53,970

Fuel = 51,045

FET = does not apply (int'l trip)

Hourly Charges = $10,030

International Handling Fees = §3,200
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The handling fees are estimates. These charges are directly passed through, once we're billed by the

handler

There is a2 1 hour minimum, so a 50 min flight would be deducted 1 hour.

trom: ich o (i
Sent: Wednesday, March'Z3, :

To: Brendan Nolan

Subject: RE: Flight Options - 1525715 3/27

Thank you

| did not see any cost figures.

Did you ever get a better feel on customs fees?

If flight only 50 mins then is that what is deducted from jet pass hours (sorry | have not read docs yet)
Is there rounding up?

Thanks

Rich Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

381 East 66th Street, Suite 18F

New York, NY 1leees
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From: Brendan Nolan [mailto | | G

Sent: Wednesday, March 23, 2011 10:46 AM
To: Rich Kahn
Subject: FW: Flight Options - 1525715 3/27

Rich,

Owner Services built a placeholder for your trip on Sunday. Itinerary is attached.

if you choose to move forward with this, please let me know and they'll reach out to you to schedule
specifics.

Thanks,

Brendan

From: Nancy Pozniak

Sent: Tuesday, March 22, 2011 7:18 PM
To: Brendan Nolan; OSRE

Subject: Flight Options - 1525715 3/27

Hi Brendan!

Here is an itinerary for the trip request you had earlier for G Maxwell[MDPC:TIST:MDPC). Please
advise the Team if client intends on moving forward. If so, will you be the go-between or is there a
someone we may contact directly?

Thank youl

MNancy
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