
To: jeevacation@gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinueeyacation@gmail.com] 
From: Cecile de Jongh 
Sent: Mon 11/28/2011 4:36:31 PM 
Subject: Re: IMPORTANT - EDC Application Fee 

OK 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and 
protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified 
that any dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly 
prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender 
immediately and delete all copies. 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation©gmail.com> 
To: Cecile de Jongh <ceciledejongh@yahoo.com> 
Sent: Monday, November 28, 2011 11:34 AM 
Subject: Re: IMPORTANT - EDC Application Fee 

i will come to the oftiice at 2 

On Mon, Nov 28, 2011 at 11:55 AM, Cecile dc Jongh < 

Jeffrey, 

wrote: 

We need to pay a $5,000 application fee to the EDA for Financial Ballistics. They 
have confirmed receipt of the application and now need the fee. We will be paying 
them with a check from your personal First Bank account. I can send the check over 
to LSJ for your signature, if you would like. This needs to be done today. 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, 
and protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby 
notified that any dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is 
strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the 
sender immediately and delete all copies. 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to icevacationftgmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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