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To: jeevacation@gmail com[jeevacation@gmail.com],
jeevacation@gmail com|jeevacation@gmail .com)

From:

Sent: Tue 11/15/2011 12:31:35 AM

Subject: Re: Bell 407 offer

sorry, there was no response from buyer regarding email counter offer of 1.8M as is,.

this was their original offer and last word we have heard from buyer: from the email traffic below, the buyer is Sir
Michael Bromley,. below is their original offer with items they wanted completed,. the broker Chuck and Tom,
agreed,, it was a low ball offer and ridiculous to request the items completed before closing,. | am having
Edwards quote the iterns anyhow, should have answer tomarrow, .

thx

Larry

----- Criginal Message-—-
From: "chris blackler” </

Sent: Thursday, November 10, 2011 11:39pm
Cc: "Sir Michael Bromley™ < . "Chris Hart” < “Louise

Bromiey” < -
Subject: N4A31GM

hi Chuck and Tom
we would like to offer 1,820,000 USD for N421GM
with following conditions

aircraft delivered to Fort Worth
. aircraft provided with an Export certificate of Airworthiness
aircraft is provided with an onboard hook installed
aircraft is provided with the Bell 407 litter kit installed
tailboom ASA 407-11-95 part 3 or 4 (as appropiate) is carried out
ECU is upgraded to reversionary type
alternativly the purchase price will be reduced by the amount that Air Centre Helicopters qoutes ta
carry out
the above
regards

Chris Blackler

Engineering Manager

Hali Miugini Limited
Papua New Guinea

Madang
P.O. Box 914,
Madang 511

Tel:

Fax:

PMNG Mob:
Int Mob:

E-mail: engineering manager@heliniugini,aero
Web: www.heliniugini.aero

In a message dated 11/14/2011 7:21:54 P.M. Eastern Standard Time, jeevacation@gmail.com writes:

no offer attached

EFTA_R1_00518130
EFTA02015240



On Tue, Nov 15, 2011 at 12:51 AM, - ot

Jeffrey,

this is what | received from the broker on the bell 407 deal,. appears they are low bidding still.
should | list the Bell 407 on Controller? if so, what asking price?

thank you,

Larry

Hi Larry,

Pretty much our sentiments as well, based on the offer price and all the mods he was requesting.

Our original offer to Chris was a net US$1,850,000 fim but as always the buyer wants to negotiate.

We will send them a reply and see what happens.

In the meantime we will continue to work behind the scenes to locate buyer with deeper pockets.

Best regards,

Chuck Hallett
Helicopter Exchange, Ltd.

Tel;
Cell
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B T - - - e

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
destray this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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