To: Mecaffrey, Carlyn |

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Sat 11/17/2012 1:44:13 PM

Subject: Re: [WARNING: MESSAGE ENCRYPTED]FW: Leon Black - form 709

now that i see you already awake? ive read many of the creditor cases , including the group i
sent, possible idea 1. either before or after we change to an adversarial trustee, |, leon gifts the
right to debra. .. I can find no case that deals with the compound transaction of cutting off a
trust right to spouse. ( a right especially that cannot invade the whole trust. ) not the settlor -
though fraudulent transfer etc. could apply. 2. decant the trust. . 3. new three- tiered partnership.
ic management interest residual interest and preferred. ( coupon of preferred to be discussed,
may be variable ) 4. decide on rectifying payout mistake not related to "relevant coS .. 5. Since
the trust is a partner in black family partners can we reorg the partnership so that it cannot
distribute any cash to 2006 trust , , hence no trust acct income. . and leon gets his money
through the gp interest instead.? Im around all weekend at || home

On Sat, Nov 17, 2012 at 7:45 AM, McCaffrey, Carlyn *:_- wrote:

Leon's 709 shows that he still had $1.74 million of gift tax credit left at the beginning of 2012
Can one of you check to see if he's made any taxable gifts during 2012 so that we know how
much he has left.

It he hasn't made any further gifts, the simplest approach 1s probably to have him make a gift
to his 1997 GST exempt trust.

Carlyn S. McCaffrey | Partner
McDermott Will & Emery LLP | 340 Madison Avenue, New York, NY 10173

From: Kirschner, Elyse
Sent: Friday, November 16, 2012 5:58 PM
To: McCaffrey, Carlyn
Subject: FW: Leon Black - form 709

Here's Leon's 2011 gifi tax return (the code to open the return is 10018).

Leon used $1.0 million of his gift tax credit through 2010, In 2011, he made taxable gifts of
$2.374 million. So, he still has about $1.74 million of his credit left.
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He used $3.5 million of his GST exemption.

He should just make a gift of $1.5 million to his 1997 GST exempt trust.

Elyse G. Kirschner | Partner
McDermott Will & Emery LLP | 340 Madison Avenue, New York, NY 10173

MWW IMwe. Com

From: Thomas Turrin

Sent: Friday, November 16, 2012 5:34 PM
To: Kirschner, Elyse

Subject: RE: Leon Black - form 709

Elyse,

The p/w is my office zip code.

I will send Debra's on Monday.

Best,

Tom

THOMAS TURRIN, CPA

Partner

Raich Ende Malter & Co. LLP
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1375 Broadway

New York, New York 10018

Mrect line)
Fax)
“ell)

Website: www.rem-co.com

From: Kirschner, Elyse [N

Sent: Friday, November 16, 2012 3:55 FM
To: Thomas Turrin
Subject: RE: Leon Black

lhanks. Can you send me Debra's too?

Elyse G. Kirschner | Partner
McDermott Will & Emery LLP | 340 Madison Avenue, New York, NY 10173

WWWL IMwe. Com

From: Thomas Turrin

Sent: Friday, November 16, 2012 3:54 PM
To: Kirschner, Elyse

Subject: RE: Leon Black

[ will forward it to you a little later.
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THOMAS TURRIN, CPA
Partner

Raich Ende Malter & Co. LLP
1375 Broadway

New York, New York 10018

Yirect line)
'ax)
“ell)

Website: www.rem-co.com

From: Kirschner, Elyse

Sent: Friday, November 16, 2012 3:21 PM
To: Thomas Turrin

Subject: Leon Black

Tom,

Do you have a copy of Leon's 2011 gift tax return?
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Thanks.

Elyse

Elyse G. Kirschner | Partner
McDermott Will & Emery LLP | 340 Madison Avenue, New York, NY 10173

| v mue.com
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IRS Circular 230 Disclosure: To comply with requirements imposed by the IRS, we inform you that any
U.S. federal tax advice contained herein (including any attachments), unless specifically stated
otherwise, is not intended or written to be used, and cannot be used, for the purposes of (i) avoiding
penalties under the Internal Revenue Code or (ii) promoting, marketing or recommending to another
party any transaction or matter herein.

This message is a PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL communication. This message and all
attachments are a private communication sent by a law firm and may be confidential or protected by
privilege. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying,
distribution or use of the information contained in or attached to this message is strictly prohibited.
Please notify the sender of the delivery error by replying to this message, and then delete it from your
system. Thank you.
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Please visit http://www.mwe.com/ for more information about our Firm.

ENDE |
MALTER CO.LLP 2 PrimeGlobal | =izers

| Independent Accounting Firms
CERTIFHELD PUBLIC ACCOUNTANTS & ADVEIDRT —-'"a'f J

CONFIDENTIALITY STATEMENT . The information contained in this electronic communication, including any and all attachments and
enclosures, may be privileged and is strictly confidential, intended solely for the use of the persanis) identified above to receive this
communication. If you are not the person(s) identified above 1o receive this communication, you are heraby notified that you may not disclose
print, copy. disseminate, or otherwise use the information contained herein. If you are an employee or agent of the personis) identified above to
recaive this communication and. as such, you have been authorized to deliver this communication to such person{s), you may disclosa, print,
copy. disseminate, or otherwise use the information contained in this communication solely for the purpose of such delivery. Unauthorized
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interception and'or use of this communication arefis strictly prohibited and may be punishable by law. If you have received this communication
in ermor, pleasa reply and notify the sender (only) of that fact and delete the communication, including any and all attachments and enclosuras,

from your camputer o other electronic device an which you may have recebved this communication.

CIRCULAR 230 DISCLOSURE: To insure compliance with requirements imposed by the Internal Revenue Service, we inform you that any tax

advice contained in this communication (including any and all attachmants), unless exprassly stated otherwise, was not intended or written to be
used and cannot be used for the purpose of (i) avoiding tax-related penalties imposed by the Internal Revenuwe Code or (i) promoting, marketing,
or recommending to anether party any transaction(s) or tax-related matter(s) addressed herein. This communication may not be forwarded [other

than to the addresses(s) identified above) without our express written consant,

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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