
To: jeevacation mail.com[jeevacation gmail.com]; 

c: jeevaca ion gmai .com eevaca ion gmail.com] 
From: brice gordon 
Sent Thur 7/19/2012 2:37:41 PM 
Subject Re: Big N 

Haul out? 
if we where to keep barge what other work would need to be done and at what cost 

On Thu, Jul 19, 2012 at 9:00 AM, Monique Harry wrote: 

Good Morning, 

Attached per (Bosco) "Big N" Pre-Sale functional repair estimate. 

MONIQUE HARRY 
Project Administrator 
1ST, Ur 

Brice Gordon 
Little Saint James 
USVI 
Phone: 
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