
To: jeevacation@gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinueevacation@gmail.com) 
From: Jeanne Brennan 
Sent: Mon 6/18/2012 9:38:02 PM 
Subject: RE: arran's details 

585.500 plus health insurance. plus 4 weeks paid vacation and holidays 

Cost to company 

592.340 salary plus tax 

59.842 health insurance • employee only 

,5102.18-'  Total cost 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Monday, June 18, 2012 5:24 PM 
To: Jeanne Brennan 
Subject: Re: arran's details 

sorry„ what was his total cost to me salary plus benfits. 

On Mon, Jun 18, 2012 at 4:50 PM, Jeanne Brennan < rote: 

Termination date: 6/18/2012 

Salary due, as of pay-period ending 6/17/2012 : $3,288.46 

Health insurance: Has been terminated will be effective 6/30/2012 

Vacation due: $ Zero , amount of $ $7563.46 (23 days) forfeited due to smoking violation 

Cell phone: Letter to ATT provided to transfer cell number to his personal account. 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation(aamail.CoM1 
Sent: Monday, June 18, 2012 4:20 PM 
To: Jeanne Brennan 
Subject: Re: Vicars transfer 

EFTA_R1_00524512 
EFTA02019717



give me arans details 

On Mon, Jun 18, 2012 at 4:16 PM, Jeanne Brennan a wrote: 

Danny Vicars transfer to LSJ. What date do you want the transfer to be effective as of: 

I will inform Brice of the package: 

Package 

$70,000 plus health insurance 

FYI : Cost to company 

$75,704 salary plus tax 

$21.120 health insurance for employee and spouse(W-4 lists he's married) 

$96,824 Total cost 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jccvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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