
To: " maitcom[jeevacation@gmail.com]; Je vacation[jeevacation@gmail.com] 
From: 
Sent Mon 12/13/2010 2:26:15 AM 
Subject Re: Dave pay 

Jeffrey, 
Yes you are correct on Dave's attitude, however, 
Rich has not cut the check yet, when I told Dave a check would be cut for 41k, he didn't want the 
money until he calculated the time also, there was a discrepancy in days worked, and also wanted 
to wait till end of the year so he could accumulate more days, is what Dave told Rich. 
I needed to review my flight logs that where in palm bch to verify days. 
thx larry 

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
Date: Sun 12 Dec 2010 19:02:47 -0500 
To: 
Subject: Re: Dave pay 

I already paid him 41k„ that was my calculation„ rich said he was very unhappy with it 

On Sun, Dec 12, 2010 at 4:48 PM, wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
I have double check Dave's work days,. 
Do you agree with paying Dave for Airline only travel days $500 ? 
Currently I have him working 80 days of flight and overnights, and 21 days of airline only days,. 
80 days minus the 50 days of salary, net 30days of work at $1,000 per day $30,000 
Airline days 21x$50 $10,500 
Total owed to date: $40,500 
Do you think this is a fare deal? 
Thanks, 
Larry 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jcevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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