
To: 
From: NI Rilr 
Sent: Mon 11/21/2011 3:27:01 PM 
Subject: Re: Bell 407 offer 

yes 

On Mon, Nov 21, 2011 at 10:08 AM, wrote: 

• ** 

> Jeffrey, here is the offer for purchase of the Bell 407, if you agree to 
> these terms, the buyer needs to get one last confirmation from final 
> purchaser this is acceptable to them,. 
> I have a phone call into the Tribe to verify their Bell 430 is still on 
> the market,. 
> thank you, 
> Larry 

> • Hi Larry, 

> • Looks like we can make the following proposal to Heli Niigini. 

> • Basic Terms: 

> Price: US$1,845,400 delivered to Air Center Helicpoters, Ft. Worth, TX. 

> -Seller pays only airworthiness discrepancies identified during Pre-buy 
> Inspection consisting of a 100 hour Airframe and 150 hour engine inspection. 

> • - Tailboom ASB and ECU Software Update shall be at Purchasers Expense. 

> Said Pre-buy inspection shall occur immediately upon arrival of Aircraft 
> at Air Center Helicopters. 

> -Refundable deposit of US$100,000 sent to the escrow agent to remove the 
> helicopter from the market pending execution of a formal Purchase 
> Agreement. Upon execution by both parties deposit shall become 
> non-refundable and released to Seller and Aircraft shall depart for Air 
> Center Helicopters, Ft. Worth, Texas.-
> 

> • -Rather than get into more specifics the above terms make it fairly 
> straight forward transaction. At closing you would pay Heli-X a commission 
> of US$40,000 and recover your fuel expenses for the delivery. Chris will 
> recover the cost of the Tailboom Mod and ECU on and off the helicopter not 
> having to pay Rod for a ferry pilot to pick up the helicopter in Ft. 
> Lauderdale. 

> • -If you are OK with the above please let us know. We can draft up a formal 
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> purchase offer or agreement to get the ball rolling. If you need to handle 
> this with your attorney in NY let us know. 

> Chris Blackler has indicated this may work but needs to run the final 
> offer by his management one last time to get approval. 

> BR 

> Chuck 
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