
To: jeevacation©gmail.com[jeevacationammail.com]; Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail corn] 
Cc: Rich Kahn[ 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent Thur 5/31/2012 5:05:18 PM 
Subject: Re: devis - Paris Mercedes 

Valdson would like to remind you that approximately a year ago (while the car was still working 
properly) MERCEDES had offered 10,000 EUROS to take this car against the purchase of a new 
MERCEDES. 
Is it still ok to go ahead with the repair? Please advise. 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On May 31, 2012, at 1:01 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

ok 

On Thu, May 31, 2012 at 12:58 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

Attached please find a quote for Mercedes repair. Total repair is $9,138.70 Euros 
(7,641.05 repair charge + 1497.65 tax) and it will take 3-4 days. Currently 
Mercedes is in the garage and it can't be used (per Valdson). 
Please advise if he can repair the car. 
Thank you 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: May 31, 2012 12:28:12 PM EDT 
To: 
Subject: devis 

valdson 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail,com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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