
invoice febr.doc 

attached is ion's invoice for I I days worked in February 2012 at $303 per day totaling S3,333.00 
Sarah has reviewed invoice for accuracy 
Do I have your permission to pay? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 1OF 
New York. NY 10065 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: ion nicola 
Date: March 4, 2012 10:43:18 PM EST 
To: 
Subject: RE: ion nicola invoice febr 1st to febr 20th, 2012 

hi rich, 
i've attached here the invoice for the month of february 2012 
i've worked febr 1st to febr 14th on 66th st (jen's apt) and febrl4th(half day) and febr 20(half 

day), so the total worked days are 11, that means $3,333.00 ($303/day) 
please let me know if got the invoice. 
thank you, 

ion nicola 
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