To: jeevacation@gmail. com[jeevacation@amail com); Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: brice gordon

Sent: Wed 4/18/2012 6:58:04 PM

Subject: Re: Quote for Hangar Painting

i did explain our painters not familiar with floor product, Kerri was the one who sourced it and
knows how to apply it
i didnt want any screw ups
also, our painters are doing nterior work of rest rooms and kitchen bath and should be finished
mid next week

the expansion joint has just been completed yvesterday, it needs to cure for a few days

Kerri in the mean time has painted the big hangar doors, roll up door and preparing floor for paint
everything should be completed by 27th
please note floor matenial will need to cure for 1 week after final application

i did try to meet the 20th deadline.

On Wed, Apr 18, 2012 at 1:51 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com= wrote:
no 1 did not,, but its ok. why can't we use the two panters we have on payroll??7??

On Wed, Apr 18, 2012 at 12:57 PM, Richard Kahn - G o -
please confirm you approved Kerri to paint hangar doors and floor for $4100

she 1s requesting a $1000 deposit
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Jeanne Brennan" i ENGTTNGGEGEG

Date: April 18, 2012 12:49:41 PM EDT

To: "Richard Kahn™
Cc: "Daphne Wallace

Subject: FW: Quote for Hangar Painting

Rich
We will process the $1,000 down payment. See below.

leanne

From: BMG [mailto: |

EFTA_R1_00533369
EFTA02025775



Sent: Wednesday, April 18, 2012 12:21 PM
To: Jeanne Brennan
Subject: Re: Quote for Hangar Painting

Approval verbal by Jeffrey

Ours painted room

Kerri was to do floors and large hangar doors
[ will forward signed copies later today

Sent from my iPhone

On Apr 18, 2012, at 10:52 AM, "Jeanne Brennan" [ G o

Brice

Can you send me the original approval on this project by JEE.
And the signed estimate for my files,

Thanks

leanne

From: brice gordon
Sent: Wednesday, April 18, 2012 7:34 AM
To: Jeanne

Cc: Daphne Wallace; _

Subject: Fwd: Quote for Hangar Painting

Kerr has already started work at TWA, can 1 please have deposit
check.
i will pickup from FTC

From: Kerri Holmes
Date: Wed, Apr 18,2012 at 7:19 AM

Subject: Quote for Hangar Painting
To: Brice Gordon I

Kerri Holmes-Eubanks
March 214, 2042
Brice Gordon
Little Saint James [sland

Quote for completion of Hangar
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Description of Work Amount

Hangar Doors

Apply 1 coat of primer and 2 coats of finish on $600.00

interior and exterior of doors

Concrete Floor

Remove the remaining 20% of old epoxy off of the concrete with a diamond grinder and small
grinders w/cup wheels and diamond blades. Patch obvious bad spots on the floor with a cement
product, clean and paint the two cistern hatches on each end of the slab, pressure wash
thoroughly removing all dirt and grease and prepare surface for applying the finish product.

Apply “Rexthane” High Gloss epoxy (white). This product is designed for Hangar floors, it is s
leveling and extremely durable.

I will apply 2 coats of the finish product to the
floor. Floor Total: $3,500.00

TOTAL AMOUNT

Down Payment Required

Balance Due

This quote is for labor only. All materials and additional equipment
will be the responsibility of Little Saint James.

Any extra work other than that quoted above will be discussed with the
appropriate person(s) and the charge will be agreed upon in writing
before the work is started.

Signed for and on behalf of the Little Saint James Island:
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[ have read, understood and agree with quotation details.

MName:

Signature:

Signed for and on behalf of the Painter:

Name: Kerri Dawn Holmes-Eubanks

Signature:

Brice Gordon
Little Saint James
USV1

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chient privileged, may
constitute nside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

.|l._‘|.|.l'l._"_'.' | ]‘JH[CiH

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
commumcation or any part thereof 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this

commumication m error, please notify us immediately by

Date:

Date:
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eturn e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereod

including all attachments. copynght -all nghts reserved

Brice Gordon

Little Saint James
USWVI
|
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