To: jeevacation@gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail.com]; jeffrey epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Rich Kahn

Sent: Tue 2/1/2011 8:44:49 PM

Subject: FW: Columbia Business School Tuition Payment for John O'Sullivan

Attached is correspondence from Johnny asking for update

| will not reply until | receive direction from you

Rich Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

381 East 66th Street, Suite 18F
New York, NY 18865

tel
fax

cel

From: Botoulas, Marilena [mailto: @columbia.edu]
Sent: Tuesday, February 01, 2011 3: M
To: nycjosi@aol.com; Rich Kahn

Cc: I Young, Leah
Subject: RE: Columbia Business School Tuition Payment for John O'Sullivan

| spoke with Mr. Kahn yesterday, lohn. | gave him the information he needs to move forward but not
sure what the next steps are here.

From: @aol.com [mailto:nycjos@aol.com]

Sent: Tuesday, February 01, 2011 3:29 PM

To: hbrkassociates.com

Cc: dkiplic.com

Subject: Fwd: Columbia Business School Tuition Payment for John O'Sullivan

Dear Rich,

Please can | have an update as to what's happening regarding paying off my Columbia student debt. |
spoke with Columbia again today and they are awaiting your call.
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Thanks and best wishes,
John

-——0riginal Message-—

From: nycjos

To:

Cc:

Sent: Fri, Jan 28, 2011 1:49 pm

Subject; Columbia Business School Tuition Payment for John O'Sullivan

Hi Rich,
Thank you for speaking to Leah Young in the Financial Aid Office at Columbia Business School. | just

spoke to Marilena Botoulas, the Director of the Financial Aid Office, and she is expecting your
call regarding settling my student account.

Marilena's contact details are:

Marilena Botoulas

Director of Financial Aid

@columbia.edu

Please let me know if there is anything that | can do to help speed things along.
Thanks and best wishes,

John

John O'Sullivan
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