To: jeevacation@gmail. com[jeevacation@agmail.com]; Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Thur 5/24/2012 9:15:59 PM

Subject: Re: Kerri

she said yes we can
Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F
New York, NY 10065

On May 24, 2012, at 5:15 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote:

ask her if you can send them the money
On Thu, May 24, 2012 at 10:38 PM, Richard Kahn <richardkahn 2@ gmail.com> wrote:

I spoke with her again and found out that she used 2 laborers (Nick and Suzzie)

Nick who is a large individual showed up at FTC on Monday and was told by Kerri to
never go there again

Neither of these two ever worked for Island Grounds Inc.

She owes them $3000 in total

If we were going to pay her $3100 she was going to send them half of the money via
western union (51550)

Please advise on amount to send Kern

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc

01 East 66th Strog suite 10

MNew York NY LE
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chent privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
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Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail. com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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