To: jeevacation@gmail jeey ioni@@gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]

Cc: Richard Kahn

From:

Sent: Tue 11/13/2012 4:07:05 PM
Subject: Desk

THe shipper 1s saying he 1s holding the desk at the harbor until we have made the transfer. THe
amount for the shipping is E 1421.00. Our original agreement with Frederic was to split the
shipping costs. Would you like to just go ahead and pay the shipper the amount in full to get it out
ASAP, and take half of the amount that we pay for shipping off from the 20000 we still owe

Frederic.

-mmmmemm-- FOrwarded message ----------
From: < -

Date: Tue, Nov 13, 2012 at 8:18 AM

Subject: Trans. : TR: BDV DECO
To:
Ce:

oeal

Your shipment is at the harbor, ready to leave.
All charges has to be paid before departure.
Best regards.

Harold

ARTEXPORT FRANCE
Antiques Trading / Packing / Shipping

1 Rue du Plaisir
93400 ST-OUEN
Tel & Fax

From:
To:
Ce: Richard Kahn <
Date: Mon, 12 Nov 2012 10:14:10 -0500
Subject: Re: TR: BDV DECO

Hi Harold,

Can you please give me a call on_

[ would like definite confirmation that the desk has shipped and expected arrival date in the US
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before | pay the invoice.

Thank you very much,

EFTA_R1_00536179
EFTA02027787



