mail. com|jeevacation@gmail com]; Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]

Subject: Re: Fwd: K & S Change order

Very frustrating how brice always supports vendors and never us. | hope Marc will shake things
up and make some drastic changes. | am sorry as | screwed up by not checking with you before
giving deposit of 1610 on plant order.

Sent from my Venizon Wireless BlackBerry

From: jeffrey epstein <jeevacation@gmail com=
Date: Sat, 12 Nov 2011 20:20:35 +0100

To:

Subject: Fwd: K & S Change order

Who does he work for!
Sorry for all the typos _Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

Date: November 12, 2011 6:40:03 PM GMT+01:00

To: Marc Dober [ NG

Ce: Gary Kermey . /:fic\ Epstcin
<jeevacation@gmail.com>, Richard Kahn <} QB NG

Subject: Re: K & S Change order

Ok
K&S are building doors, but they need to manufacture the frame to hang the
doors

This frame will so allow us to remove the doors in the event of a hurricane

Install cost includes

Frame design

Manufacturing of frame

Setting of frame

Hardware install

Please note there are no shop drawing to go by

Hope this helps
We still do not have Internet on LSJ
Working with I phones only service still bad
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Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 12, 2011, at 10:01 AM, "Marc Dober” —} Wrote:

Ok

But why 5750 per door?

From: [
Sent: Saturday, November 1.2, :

To: Marc Dober
Cc: Gary Kerney; Jeffrey Epstein; Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: K & 5 Change order

Let's be clear 1t 1s 2 pairs of doors total 4 doors that are be hung

Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 12, 2011, at 9:31 AM, "Marc Dober" <|| | G- ot

Gary,

| am on island Menday and will discuss with Tom but why
does it cost 53000 to install two doors. What is special about
these? Is there a special piece of equipment that is needed to
hang them? If you can provide some details on that Tom and |
can go back to K&S

Thanks

Marc

From: Gary Kerney (o
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Sent: Saturday, November 12, 2011 8:28 AM

To: Jeffr in

Cc: I —— M Richard Kahn; mark dober
Subject: RE; K & S Change order

when k&s bid the wind doors the bid was worded as two pair of doors. Shelia the
business partner wrote the bid up but using $7,200 the price
of one opening.| found this out after | left and suggested that
Tom go back to them and tell them that they should give us
the second opening for $3,800 because they made the eror
on the bid.

The good thing is Kent does very good work, the bad is they run a poor business
.the other bid we got was $18,000+

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto: jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Thu 11/10/2011 2:43 PM

To: Gary Kerney
Cc: Richard Kahn; mark dober
Subject: Fwd: K & S Change order

im unclear about what you agreed.. installation for 3000 dollars.? bathroom
windows for 3800

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: brice gordon <G
Date: Thu, Nov 10, 2011 at 5:18 PM

Subject: K & S Change order

To: jeevacation@omail com

Cc¢: Marc Dober =

>_Rich Kahn

Jeffrey

attached is a change order for one pair additional breezeway doors and two
bathroom windows for the relax room

The initial quote was only for one pair ( $7200.00) of louvered doors not 2
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pair. K & S are supplying the second door for S3800

Tom has reviewed and approved scope of work

are you OK with this?

Brice (zordon
Little Samnt James
USWVI

The mformation contamed in this communication 18
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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