
To: jeevacation©gmail.com[jeevacation©gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinbeeyacation©gmail.com] 
From: Cecile de Jongh 
Sent Mon 1/17/2011 2:00:43 PM 
Subject Re: 

It was declined and he got them to not charge him (they were charges that should have been paid 
by others in the group). His final charge was only $8 for which he represent paid in cash. 

John asked Kenn to speak with Hancock - I will follow up and get back to you. 

With warm regards, 
Cecile 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 17, 2011, at 9:44 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

what finally happened with als credit card.. ? do you think i should personally call 
michael hancock? 
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