To: jeevacation@gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Wed 2/16/2011 11:26:31 AM

Subject: FW: accounts

Please advise

From: Linda PINTO |

Date: Wed, 16 Feb 2011 12:16:13 40100
To: "HBRK Inc.
Cc: Chandara RAMADAN! <

Subject: accounts

| received your email and | must say | find it rather impolite.
We are owed 12 816€ since January 2010 over a year ago.

Mr Epstein bought some items and he asked us to sell those items. We try to do
our best and the remaining item to sell is the belts. Now we are still trying to sell
them and we will reimburse Mr Epstein only when they will be sold, or we can
send them back to Mr Epstein immediately.

| do not think it is normal for you to ask us the contrary.

So please pay us what is owed us and we will of course pay Mr Epstein as soon
as we sell the belts.

Regards

Linda PINTO

Cabinet Alberto Pinto
11 rue d'Aboukir
75002 Paris

www.albertopinto.com
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