To: i i il [je i i . Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: ' "

Sent: Sat 9/17/2011 8:58:10 PM

Subject: Re: Big N Refurbishment

FYI
This should not affect the completion schedule

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 17, 2011, at 4:38 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@ gmail.com> wrote:

nothing happens until after oct 31

On Sat, Sep 17, 2011 at 11:04 AM, brice gordon <} GGG *otc:

Jeffrey

Attached is the estimate for the repair of Big N

if we keep the barge then recommend full refurbishment (@ estimated cost of
$48,872.00

if we sell the barge in the new year, then recommend refurbishment @ estimated
cost of $33, 862.00

my recommendation is, haul out, confirm scope of work and cost, then proceed
with only necessary repair to get us though the next few months

please note we do need to haul out to do the rams,

do i have you approval

Brice Gordon
Little Saint James
LISWVI

Phone:
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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