
To: jeevacationepgmaitcom[jeevacation©gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinbeeyacation©gmail.com] 
From: brice gordon 
Sent Tue 1/3/2012 4:04:04 PM 
SubJect Re: LSJ: Pools 

pool l x 1 tile 3 weeks CA to STT 
the rest of the material couple weeks 
please note we still water line tile selection if you decide to change color 

On Tue, Jan 3, 2012 at 11:11 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail,com> wrote: 

call me re barne 

On Tuc, Jan 3, 2012 at 9:47 AM, brice gordon wrote: 

relayed to Rex, they ( Rex and Ban ) will be contacting Darren or myself with response 

On Mon, Jan 2, 2012 at 7:40 PM, jeffrey epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

30k due 

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhonc 

On Jan 2, 2012, at 2:53 PM, brice gordon ME=Ma wrote: 

> confirming 

> order materials for main compound pool 
> that you wish to tile the main house pool first then replaster flag pool 
> i will confirm time frame for material delivery tomorrow, estimate 3 wks tops if tile is still in 

stock 
> 20k to pool company now, what are the final terms for payment, when both pools are 

complete? 
> balance due would be, Just want to be clear in regard to terms you are offering. 

> --
> Brice Gordon 
> Little Saint James 
> USVI 
> Phone: 

Brice Gordon 
Little Saint James 
USVI 

EFTA_R1_00541590 
EFTA02031466



*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return c-mail or by c-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

Brice Gordon 
Little Saint James 
USVI 
Phone: 
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