
To: jeevacation©gmail.com[jeevacation©gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinbeevacation©gmail.com] 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Wed 9/21/2011 4:03:57 PM 
Subject: Re: Pralaya 

great. I will have Rich take care of for her 
On Sep 21, 2011, at 12:03 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

yes 

On Wed, Sep 21, 2011 at 12:00 PM, wrote: 

is asking if she could possibly pick up her final tuition check for 
$7072.00. She is on her way to pick up her money for the island now. 
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