
To: jeevacation©gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail.corrt Rich Kah 
Cc: Jeffrey Epsteinfieevacation©gmail.com]; Karen Gordo 
From: brice gordon 
Sent Fri 11/30/2012 6:29:22 PM 
Subject Fwd: Aspen invoice 253 

approval from JE 

----- Forwarded 
From: brice gordon 
Date: Tue, Sep II, 2012 at 11:50 AM 
Subject: Re: Aspen 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com>

sorry i thought we discussed clean canvas for this visit so we could review plan and plant 
material, so i could develop a precise estimate for next year planting 

On Tue, Sep 11, 2012 at 11.46 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jcevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

I had asked that it wait until my trips were complete„ but ok 

On Tue, Sep II, 2012 at 1:45 PM, brice gordon < wrote: 

FYI 
Aspen have started clearing of dead over grown material from Kitchen beds, parking area, 
will finish up wednesday 

All irrigation pipes and ground light wires will be covered, there cost was not exceed 
3800.00, i'll keep an eye on hours and man power 
The Ponderosa pines are scheduled to be removed later 

Brice Gordon 

USVI 
Phone: 

New Mexico 
Phone: 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(agmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

Brice Gordon 

USVI 
Phone: 

New Mexico 
Phone: 

Brice Gordon 

USVI 
Phone: 

New Mexico 
Phone: 
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