
To: 'eevacation mail.com[jeeyacation@gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinbeevacation©gmail.com] 
From: 
Sent Thur 9/15/2011 8:21:59 PM 
Subject Re:aptop needs work 

I wallet know she can get her laptop fixed and you will pay. :) 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 15, 2011, at 4:11 PM, Jeffrey Epstein t_exacationggmail com> wrote: 

ok 

On Thu, Sep 15, 2011 at 3:40 PM wrote: 

has her Ipad up and running.. she is downloading apps and happy...she 
used her own credit card since it stores the card on the device...she has purchased 
a few apps and downloaded free ones. 

While trying to get the [pad up, she realized she needed to upgrade the software for her 
laptop. She purchased the software, but it won't load because her CD drive is 
broken. She can have the drive repaired for about $160-$190. She also needs a 
new back up hard drive, about $69. It is an old computer, but she says she is 
quite happy with it. 
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