
To: jeevacation©gmaitcomfjeeyacationetgmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinheevacation©gmaii corn] 
From: Scott Denett 
Sent Thur 1/27/2011 9:20:19 PM 
Subject Re: Sony Quiallia 

Ok just left him a message to do so 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 27, 2011, at 4:11 PM, Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@grnail.com> wrote: 

have nick send you all the specs on the 2d and 3d dpi projectors. 

On Thu, Jan 27, 2011 at 10:04 PM, Scott Denett wrote: 

http://svww.barco.cornien/productcategory/1 
any opinion on this company ? 

scott 

On Jan 27, 2011, at 4:00 PM, wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
I have located a Projector repair center in Georgia that is famiiar with Sony 
Quallia,. Initial cost to calibrate and adjust settings $895.00 flat fee, if any 
discrepancies are found, will be quoted and additional,. 
I hesitate to send to this company, until I hear back from Sony on where they 
recommend to send quallia,. 

Nick has spoken to Sony Tech support that deals with the Quallia, There exact 
words according to Nick, where the same recommendation that Kevin Law's 
guy Neil Greeberg at Audio Interiors told me,. 
Sony said not to invest any money in the Quallia since its out dated technology, 
, cheaper brighter projectors are currently available for a 1/4 of the cost of the 
Quillia,. and repair cost from Sony is high,. 
I sent Rob (head Tech support for Sony, and Quiallia expert) an email, and 
asked where we should send the projector to be caibrated, serviced and cost,. 

From Nick: 
Larry, this email is for Rob, he is the main Qualia projector Tech support 
guru. He is the guy to ask about sony qualia service questions 
I spoke with Tim who is Rob's counter partner and told me for you to 
email him your request. 

Nick Lambros 
Sound X 
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360 w. Northwest Highway 
Office 847-382 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to je_evacation@gmail,com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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