
To: jeevacation©gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinueevacation@gmail.com] 
From: 
Sent: Thur 10/27/2011 2:30:46 PM 
Subject: Fwd: receivable from Epstein 

i will ignore until you tell me otherwise 
Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Gary Kerney" 
Date: October 25, 2011 8:03:27 PM EDT 
To: "Rich Kahn"  
Cc: "Sharon Myers" 
Subject: FW: receivable from Epstein 

Rich 
Did you find the outstanding invoice ,and is there a chanch Jeffrey will 
pay it? 

From: Sharon Myers 
Sent: Tue 10/25/2011 4:48 PM 
To: Gary Kerney 
Subject: receivable from Epstein 

Gary-

This is a friendly reminder that Epstein still owes Landmark for one month of your 
salary. Do you think you could get him to pay us before you leave the island? 

Sharon C jttre•re 
Landmark IMO COMpan1% 
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