
To: Bella Klein 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Wed 10/5/2016 6:04:22 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Dr. Kirsch for Margherita $350 today 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation(&lmail.com>
Subject: Re: Dr. Kirsch for Margherita $350 today 
Date: October 5, 2016 at 1:18:54 PM EDT 
To: Lesley Groff 

ok 

On Wed, Oct 5, 2016 at 1:14 PM, Lesley Groff <MIIMIa> wrote: 

Dr. Kirsch was paid $350 for Margherita's appointment she had today...on your 
Amex. She has another appt on Oct 18th.. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jcevacationOgmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA_R1_00565474 
EFTA02040642


