From: aryna Shulia

Sent: Sat 9/24/2016 2:01:22 PM
Subject: Re: Tawaraya Hotel Confirmed! Sept 26-Oct 1 KARYNA SHULIAK

Thank you -.' [ will check with them again, if they still have a problem it might be casier to
just use my card.

On Sep 24, 2016, at 10:59 PM, [ ENGIGNGNGEEEEEEE o

Hello concierge agam. . here is our confirmation of Tawaraya hotel ... .we were
under the impression the Tawaraya had the Amex as well. .. Please do know we
wish all charges for the Tawaraya and any and all mcidentals to go on the Amex on
file ending in- Thank you...

Begin forwarded message:

rrom: [,
Subject: Tawaraya Hotel Confirmed! Sept 26-Oct 1

Date: September 14, 2016 at 6:08:35 PM EDT

To: Karyna Shuliak

<K.Shuliak cf.pdf>
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