
To: 
From: 
Sent ue 25:48 PM 
Subject Re: does JE pay for his brothers apt at 301? 

Richard Kahn 

Ok thanks. Bella was was not sure 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 20, 2016, at 4:59 PM, Richard Kahn 

I will check and get back to you. Thanks. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 20, 2016, at 4:49 PM, a wrote: 

ote: 

Does JEffrey pay for his brothers apt at 301? apt 12C...it has been on 
the apartment list forever 
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