
To: 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent Tue 9/20/2016 9:30:38 PM 
Subject: Re: does Je pay for his brothers apt at 301? let us know ASAP! 

Did u find answer from Rich 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Sep 20, 2016, at 4:43 PM, wrote: 

Hi Bella...jeffrey is asking if he pays for his brothers apt at 301? It is on the list of 
apartments and has been forever...it is I2C...please let us know ASAP!! 

thanks 
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