
To: Lesley Groffilesleyjee©gmail.coml 
Cc: Chad Jennifer Andiaj 
Fran: Christian Glauser Benz 
Sent Mon 9/12/2016 12:14:28 PM 
Subject: Re: Oppenheim_USVI_concept invoice and wire Instructions 

Hi Lesley, 

Thanks. Looking forward. 

Kind regards, 

Christian 

CHRISTIAN GLAUSER BENZ 
VICE PRESIDENT 

OPPENHEIM 
ARCHITECTURE 

245 NE 37 STREET MIAMI FL 33137 
OPPEN.COM 

MIAMI / NEW YORK / BASEL 
ER 21 

On Sep 11, 2016, at 7:20 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

hello Christian and sorry for delayed reply! We are waiting on Jeffrey's lawyer to 
review...he should be back on Tuesday! 

On Sep 8, 2016, at 6:31 PM, Christian Causer Benz 
wrote: 

Hi Lesley, 

I hope you are doing well. 

We were wondering if Jeff had a chance to review the contract and if he had made a 
decision. 

We would like to set a design team aside for this given we are pretty busy this 
month already and recall Jeff mentioning he wanted to get this going 
fairly soon so he could review the final designs before thanksgiving. 
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Feel free to share this with him and let us know how we should proceed. If need be, 
he can reach Chad at his mobile directly at 305-4393540. He is in 
Miami now. 

Thanks so much! 

Kind regards, 

Christian 

CHRISTIAN GLAUSER BENZ 
VICE PRESIDENT 

OPPENHEIM 
ARCHITECTURE 

245 NE 37 STREET MIAMI FL 33137 
OPPEN.COM 

MIAMI / NEW YORK / BASEL 

On Sep 7, 2016, at 7:37 AM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

Good morning! I will find out! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 7, 2016, at 7:12 AM, Christian Glauscr Benz 

wrote: 

Good morning Lesley, 

Was Jeff able to view this? Just making sure as we didn't hear back 
from him. 

Kind regards, 

Christian 
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CHRISTIAN GLAUSER BENZ 
VICE PRESIDENT 

OPPENHEIM 
ARCHITECTURE 

245 NE 37 STREET MIAMI FL 33137 
OPPEN.COM 

MIAMI / NEW YORK / BASEL 
MOM 

On Sep 2, 2016, at 10:41 AM, Lesley Groff < 
wrote: 

Great. Thank you. I will pass 
this along. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 2, 2016, at 10:36 AM, Christian Glauser Benz 

wrote: 

Hi Lesley, 

As promised here is the invoice with wire instructions for 
Jeff. 

I copied Ximena who takes care of our project accounting 
in case there are 
any questions 
regarding this. 

Have a great weekend. 

<OA Invoice 
01618090216 - 
USVI Island.pdf> 

Kind regards, 
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Christian 

CHRISTIAN 
GLAUSER BENZ 
VICE 
PRESIDENT 

OPPENHEIM 
ARCHITECTURE 

245 NE 37 
STREET MIAMI 
FL 33137 
OPPEN.COM 

MIAMI / NEW 
YORK/BASEL 
EMMEN 
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