
To: 
Cc: Lesley Grof 
Fran: 
Sent .16 PM 
Subject Re: Vlsa_JE_Sunrise Medical Lab_forM1976 80_090616_conf 006853.pdf 

Thank you so much! 

On Tuesday, September 6, 2016, bellaklein wrote: 

Paid 1976.80 fontoday, bill was paid before 
Thank you, 
Bella 

bellaklein 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: w : Invoices rom • • 

T
Date: SeptembiligliNDT 
To: Bella Klein

Hello Bella! 
1976.80$ is for 
814.60$ is mine 

Thank you 

----- Forwarded messa e 
From: Lesley Groff 
Date: Tuesday, September 6 2016 
Subject: Invoic 
To.
Cc: 

EFTA_R1_00575504 
EFTA02044286


