
To: Tes[ 
Cc: merwin dela cruz[ ; Leo[ 
From: 
Sent: Fri 7/29/2016 11:13:26 PM 
Subject: 10E1 air mattress /clean 7J August 4 

Tess, we will need to set up the air mattress in 10B for guests arriving on aug 
5. We may have 4 girls stay in there! We will also need 10B cleaned on Thursday 
August 4. Bobby will leave early on the 4th. (It's possible we split the party 
up and put 2girls in 7J and 2 in 10 B on August 5). Not sure yet. 0 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Jul 29, 2016, at 6:12 PM, Tes < 

• You're very welcome! It's my pleasure to help in that kind of 
situation. It work out good helping at the house specially with the boss needed, 
my first time making breakfast and preparing food for him and his guest. Not 
perfect but I did my very 
• Thank you so much. but she said that the 
still doing a that they found a i. 
so they need to so they can find out what is it. Hope and pray 
everything is okey on her health. Thank you so much for everyone support. 
> Sent from my iPhone 

» On Jul 29, 2016, at 5:04 PM, wrote: 
>> 
» Excellent! Thank you so much Tess and Thank you so very much for helping out 
at the house when needed you! I know she greatly appreciates it..so 
does Jeffrey the best. Have a good weekend.

> wrote: 

» Sent from my iPhone 

>» On Jul 29, 2016, at 4:41 PM, Tes < > wrote: 
>» 
>>> 
>» 7J is ready for upcoming guest Bobby Slayton on Monday. Apartment 10B not 
ready yet I have no time after clean 7J I'll be there to clean it on Monday. 
Thank you and have a good weekends. 
>» 
>>> 
>>> Sent from my iPhone 
>>> 
>>» On Jul 29, 2016, at 7:21 AM, 
>>» 
>>» Larry stayed in 7J. Is it possible to have it cleaned today? We have Bobby 
Slayton arriving early on Monday to stay there. We also will have 10B available 
to clean today after 12:30. If we need to wait until Monday to clean 10B that is 
ok but I will need 10B cleaned Monday as we have more guests arriving next week. 
Please confirm we can get 7J cleaned today and 10B on Monday. Thanks 
>>» 
»» Sent from my iPhone 

wrote: 
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