o Lesey cror [

From: jeffrey E.
Sent: Tue 7/12/2016 6:49:17 PM

Subject: Re: Ticket for ([ -CK to purchase
Ok

On Tuesday, 12 July 2016, Lesley Groff _ wrote:

-is requesting below ticket. $1354.56. OK to purchase?

SuU 103 05AUG JFK SVOOTI0P 1115A

S8

suU 1202 0OBAUG SVO PEE 0305P 0705P

3 suU 1201 14AUG PEE SVO 1255P 0105P
SuU 102 14AUG SVO JFK 0225P 0520P

Lad

TOTAL FARE - USD 1354.56

Sent from my iPhone

please note
The information contammed n this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copymg of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
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