
To: 
From: bellaklein 
Sent: Wed 7/13/2016 5:28:55 PM 
Subject: Re: johanna 

thanks 
Thank you, 
Bella 

> On Jul 13, 2016, at 1:27 PM, Lesley Groff <lesley.jee@gmail.com> wrote: 

> • Below is text from Johanna 

> Payment has gone through its all wired and Done! Tell Him thank you again and I 
also wrote Him a message on Skype satin thank you. Is he in New York around the 
20 of aug? 
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