To:  Bella Kiein
Cc: Rich Kahn

From:

Sent: Mon 6/20/2016 6:02:08 PM
Subject: Re: Confirmation required

Jeffrey approved the 15 K
Will send you email. ..

On Jun 20, 2016, at 2:01 PM, bellaklein _ wrote:

Rich/Lesley,

Attached please find email from Dr Kruger son. He 1s asking for 15K: 10K for JE and 5
for girls. JE would like to pay only 10K for all. Les, please communicate to JE
and advise

Thank you,
Bella

Begin forwarded message:
From: Benjamin Kruger

Subject: Confirmation required
Date: June 20, 2016 at 1:51:09 PM EDT
To:

Hi Bella,

After speaking with Dr. Kruger, he said that Mr. Epstein had agreed to a flat fee of
515,000 for himself plus the five girls, which would constitute a 25%
discount.

Please confirm that this i1s correct and 1 will send a revised contract.
Many thanks!

Ben Kruger

Priority Private Care

170 E. 78th Street
New York, NY 10021
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