
To: bellaklei 
From: 
Sent: Mon 6/13/2016 4:49:27 PM 
Subject: Re: 

Thanks. Do I start using this now? Is that month 6 or 8 on the card? I think 6 
but want to make sure 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Jun 13, 2016, at 12:37 PM, bellaklein wrote: 

> Please update your files 

> • cAmex_Black_JEP_4009_JE walet_061316.pdf> 

> • Thank you, 
> Bella 
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