
To: 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Tue 6/7/2016 11:49:56 PM 
Subject: Re: SkyBoard Order Confirmation #R678109391 

We don't need this in NY or Paris. We don't need it at all. I was merely trying to find out if it was 
possible to order one of these in Paris and send to daughter because we can't ship one 
from NY to Paris. We do not need one here in NY. We have one already! I want him to cancel 
the order completely 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Jun 7, 2016, at 6:17 PM wrote: 

Hi Les, 
He said he had purchased it but put the NY address. I lc didn't say that he had 
ordered it again 

On Tuesday, June 7, 2016, Lesley Groff wrote: 

So sorry Valdson! Please CANCEL this order. 
M, can you make sure Valdson cancels this order. I was only asking if it was available in 

Paris! Sony for confusion. I didn't want him to order it! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 7, 2016, at 4:33 PM, valdson cotrin wrote: 

hello mme Lesley. 
je achetez le skyboard mais je mis l'adresse de new york. 

 Forwarded message 
From: SkyBoard 
Date: 2016-06-07 22:12 GMT+02:00 
Sub'ect: S1 Board Order Confirmation #R678 109391 
To:

Thank you for your order! 

Hi valdson 
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This email contains important information about your recent purchase. 
Please save it for future reference. 

Thank you for your business! 

SkyBoard 

Order # R678109391 Date 2016-06-07 

Shipping Address Billing Address 

valdson vieira cotrin valdson vieira cotrin 

Shipping Information 

Ships Free 

Order Summary 

6.5 inch SkyBoard w/ Bluetooth (1) $399.99 
Color Black:Red Free Shipping 

SKU 0011 

Subtotal $399.99 

Shipping (Ships Free) $0 .00 

Order Total $399.99 

Payment Information 
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Payment method 

Reference # 
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