
To: Bebe Avdiu bebe.dkiplIc©gmall.cong 
From: 
Sent: Wed 5/25/2016 7:11:12 PM 
Subject: Re: Print for Darren now... 

:) 
OK, you have my contribution to this fun project...You should be all set...just need signatures, 
JE's passports, a picture...put it all in a fed ex envelope and have Leo take it to fed ex tomorrow 
(mark for early arrival)... We will NOT need a check from Bella as the $170 is part of the 
payment on Darren's CC...Appreciate all your help! :) 

On May 25, 2016, at 3:05 PM, Bebe Avdiu allIMIM wrote: 

ok. Thanks 

Bebe Avdiu 
Legal Assistant 
DARREN K. INDYKE. PLLC 
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, and is intended 
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On May 25, 2016, at 3:00 PM, wrote: 

Bebe, please print that renewal app now and show to Darren and 
make sure he doesnt want any changes...tell him the app did not 
require dates of travel...no asterisk was there so i left blank....thanks 
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