To: (N
From: SOOn yi previn

Sent: Thur 5/26/2016 12:02:07 PM

Subject: Re: Saturday May 28th Hair and Makeup

Thank you

Sent from Soon-Yi's iPhone €
On May 26, 2016, at 6:51 AM,— wrote:

me too! and the Naoko girl did CALL ME! and I asked her to email me her info
(which she has done) and Jettrey will send her a check for $300 . _felt a it bad, but
told her | hope she could get some of her other business back and get her $500
from JE...! (win/win?!)

On May 25, 2016, at 10:51 PM, soon yi previn

I'm so glad and relieved that it's all finalized.

Sent from Soon-Y1's iPhone €
On May 25, 2016, at 9:52 PM, ||| -

Hi Soon Yi and Helen. Jeffrey confirmed the $2500 for
both movie biz girls is fine. We will be set on Saturday to

pay them both in cash. 'I'hanks.-

Sent from my iPhone

On May 25, 2016, at 9:44 PM, soon yi1 previn '-’-_3*

wrote:

As far as | know, we are going with your
make up and hair person. | had checked with
Jeffrey carlier and he had said that he wanted
the people from the movie business. The
person my friend recommended for the make
up will come another time. -said that
Jeftrey is on a plane now so [ will just make
sure that the $2500 for the make up person
15 OK with um. He already approved the
$2500 for the hair person. | hope to have this
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all wrapped up & good to go by tomorrow

morning. I've included Jettrey in this

email stream. Jeffrey please confirm that the
price is OK for you. | don't want to spend
your money without your approval nor do I

want to be held responsible for this
charge/holding the bag

=)

Sent from Soon-Y1's iPhone €

On May 25, 2016, at 9:01 PM, Helen Robin <|| | | G

Sent from my 1Phone

wrote:

Just want to make sure we're all

in agreement. The makeup and

hair person I got are fine to
come, yes? And the person you
found is going there another

time?

On May 25, 2016, at 8:33 PM, soon y1 previn
< I

wrote:

Ongmally you
couldn't find a
make up person
from the movie
business. You could
only find a hair
person for $2500.
The make up
person that I got
through my friend
was $200 a head.
Then when you
were able to find a
make up person
from the movie
business, as Jeffrey
original wanted,
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that is when we
made the switch to
use your make up
person. [ had no
idea how much
your make up
person would cost.
I assumed that it
would be around
the same as your
hair person. | hope
this clarifies the
confusion.

In order to cancel the original hair person, whom we got
through my
friend, who is not in
the movie business
Jettrey has oftered
to pay $500 now
and she can come
and service it
another time,

Sent from Soon-Y1i's iPhone €

On May 25, 2016, at 7:18 PM, Helen Robin

Your
welco
me

| —

come
back to
me and
said
yolul
had
said
makecu
p was
5200 a
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person,
but |
explain
ed that
I
though
t that
was a
none
movie
person,
but 1
had
found
one
last
minute,
50
that’s
the
rate.
She
said 1t
should
be fine,
she has
to pass
it by
Jeffrey
who 15
flying
at the
momen
.
Hope
there’s
no
1SSUCS

On May 25, 2016, at 4:25 PM, soon yi previn

As always, thank you for being so thorough.
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Thank you for setting up what sounds like a
fun day on Saturday

Sent from Soon-Yi's iPhone €

On May 25, 2016, at 3:28 PM, Helen Robin

Hi Everyone,

Alexandra 1s Makeup and Sarah is Hair -
they are both in the film business and
available for the work requested this
Saturday.

- 15 the assistant to Jeffrey Epstein -
her cell number is

The address is 9 East 71st St. and the
time 1s 1:30P. It 1s a private residence.

I i fee for each of them to

work on five women 1s $2500. This 1s
to be paid in cash please.

Thank you,
Helen

Helen
Rohin
Perdido
Product
ions,
Inc.
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