
To: Charter TeamPlinall 
Cc: Rich Kahn Mark Wieser : Larry 
Visoski Larry 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Thur 3/17/2016 9:58:00 PM 
Subject Re: JetSuite Off Fleet Quote 

arrival time will be? 

On Mar 17, 2016, at 5:56 PM, Charter Team wrote: 

Hello Richard, you are confirmed for a 7:30 departure this evening. Please let us know if 
there is anything else we can get for you. 

Eric Dufay 

JetSuite Charter 

Offering WiFi-equipped Phenom 100s & CJ3s. 
To Fly: 866 779 7770 

LEGAL DISCLAIMER 
The information transmitted is intended solely for the individual or entity to whom it is addressed and Inc 
confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of or take 
reliance upon this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If yo 
received this email in error please contact the sender and delete the material from any computer. 

On Thu, Mar 17, 2016 at 2:03 PM, Richard Kahn <riehardkahnI2Ogmail.com> wrote: 

thank you for update 
is it possible to move departure time to 7:30pm tonight? 
please confirm 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

EFTA_R1_00598192 
EFTA02056141



On Mar 17, 2016, at 4:17 PM, Charter Team 
wrote: 

Hello Richard, attached is the itinerary for you and you are all set for tonight. This 
aircraft is based at Atlantic Aviation in TEB so that is where you will 
arrive into. If your cars are at Meridian we can arrange 
transportation over there. Thank you and please let us know if there 
is anything else we can do for you. 

Eric Dufay 

JetSuite Charter 

Offering WiFi-equipped Phenom 100s & CJ3s. 

To Fly 

LEGAL DISCLAIMER 
The information transmitted is intended solely for the individual or entity to whom it is addressed 
contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or Mb 
taking action in reliance upon this information by persons or entities other than the intended recg 
prohibited. If you have received this email in error please contact the sender and delete the mater 
computer. 

On Thu, Mar 17, 2016 at 12:14 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

we would like to proceed with Lear 55 returning back tonight 
can you please confirm 

I accept all terms and conditions of quote 
#9233720 and decline my option to 
purchase additional wait time- you may 
charge the AMEX credit curd on file 
ending in 6012. 
(15 minutes of complimentary wait time is 
included) 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

EFTA_R1_00598193 

EFTA02056142



On Mar 17, 2016, at 2:47 PM, Charter Team 
ca wrote: 

Hello Richard, 
Attached are two options for tonights trip from BED-TEB. The Hawker 

800XP has a WIFI and a brand new interior. As Mark 
explained you can use the funds for the leg tonight and 
then pay the difference. The extra amount would be 
$2871.41 for the Hawker 800XP, and the cost for the 
Lear 55 would be $1242.78. Thank you very much and 
please let us know if there is anythign else we can do 
for you. 

Eric Dufay 
JetSuite Charter 

Offering om 100s & CJ3s. 
To Fly: •

LEGAL DISCLAIMER 
The information transmitted is intended solely for the individual or entity to whom it is adc 
may contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemin 
other use of or taking action in reliance upon this information by persons or entities other 
intended recipient is prohibited. If you have received this email in error please contact the 
delete the material from any computer. 

STetSuite(Learjet 55).pdf>e4etSuite(Hawker 800XP) 
(15).pdf><Hawker800XP_N254SB_Ipg_2014.06.06.pdf> 

<JetSuite 17-Mar-2016 SA default passenger trip sheet.pdf> 

CetSuite 17-Mar-2016 SA default passenger trip sheet (2).pdf> 

EFTA R1_00598194 
EFTA02056143


