I —

From: jeffrey E.
Sent: Thur 3/17/20168404:36 PM
Subject: Re: Ticket for to Houston

Yes

On Thursday, 17 March 2016, — wrote:

Julia says you approved her ticket to Houston.

1 UA 1973 18MAR LGA TAH 0939A1251P
2 UA 1254 2IMAR IAH LGA 1259P0529P

TOTAL FARE - USD  787.20

Sent from my iPhone
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