To: bellaklein

From:

Sent: Thur 3/24/2016 6:30:32 PM
Subject: Re: Amex

Will do

Sent from my iPhone
On Mar 24, 2016, at 2:23 PM, bellaklein _ wrote:

ok, please let me know
Thank you,
Bella

WIoLe:

I didn't even think they had his Amex number! Very odd and I do not know what it
15. I will ask their accounting dept

Sent from my iPhone

On Mar 24, 2016, at 2:04 PM, bellaklein ~'-:I_ wrote:

yes

Thank you,
Bella

e [

WIrote:

[s this on JEs Amex?

Sent from my iPhone
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On Mar 24, 2016, at 1:21 PM, bellaklein ||| NN

wrote:

Hi Les

Please confirm below charge

02/17/2016  FAIRMONT

WATERFRONT 1,183.25
VANCOUVER CA

02/17/2016 FAIRMONT
WATERFRONT 1,183.25

VANCOUVER CA

Thank you,
Bella
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