To: Bella Klei

From:

Sent: Wed 3/16/2016 3:47:30 PM
Subject: Re: Paystub 03/M17/16

thank you!....i have not rec’d the check you sent last week for reimbursement as of yet.... so
odd! maybe today?

On Mar 16, 2016, at 11:42 AM, bellaklein _ wrote:

fii
Thank you,
Bella

Begin forwarded message:

From
Date: March 16, 2016 at 11:37:14 AM EDT
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