
To: Dangene Enterpriselli 
From: 
Sent: Thur 3/17/2016 4:09:32 PM 
Subject: Re: Kathy Ruemler 

wait...1 see another invoice...can you send to me in a separate email? 

On Mar 17, 2016, at 12:04 PM, Appointment 
wrote: 

Hello 

I am sending you the invoice for Kathy Ruemmler's package purchases. 

Please let me know if you have any questions. 

Have a great day! 

Best, 

Nicole 

Dangene: The Institute of Skinovation 

Twitter: @dangene 

appointment@dangene.com 

From 
Date: Thursday, March 17, 201610:20 AM 
To: DANGENE ENTERPRISE 
Subject: Re: Kathy Ruemle 

Great. I will call you in about an hour with card number. Thanks! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 17, 2016, at 10:18 AM, Appointment 

Hi 

Happy Thursday! 

I would be more than happy to take care of Kathy's package for Jeffrey. 

wrote: 
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What is the best number I can reach you at to get the credit card he would like us to use? 

Many thanks! 

Best, 

Nicole 

@dangene 

Dangene: The Institute of Skinovation 

appointment@dangene.com 

From: 
Date: Wednesday, March 16, 2016 at 4:33 PM 
To: Dangene Institute 
Cc: Jennie Dangene Institute .41 , 

Bella Klein 
Subject: Re: Kathy Ruemler 

Jeffrey is paying for Kathy's appointment for today! Please do not bill Kathy! thanks... 

On Mar 16 2016 at 9:15 AM, Nicole Piscioneri 
wrote: 

Good Morning Leslie, 

Happy Wednesday! 

Yes, we will be seeing Kathy today at 1pm. 

Have a wonderful day! 

Best, 

Nicole Piscioneri 

Client Experience Manager 

@dangene 
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From 
Date: Wednesday, March 16, 2016 8:40 AM 
To: Jennie 
Cc: DANGENE ENTERPRISE , DANGENE ENTERPRISE 

Subject: Re: Kathy Ruemler 

Reconfirming Kathy will come see you today for a facial at 1pm! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 3, 2016, at 7:14 AM, Dangene and Jennie Enterpris 
wrote: 

GREAT !!! 
<EWLarge2.jpg> 

CORE: Jennie Enterprise 
@dandjenterprise I Founder & 
Chairman 

www.coreaccess.netI

On Mar 2, 2016, at 8:54 PM, 

wrote: 

kathy has confirmed she will come see you at 1pm on WEd. march 16th 
On Mar 2, 2016, at 3:06 PM, Dangene and Jennie Enterprise 

1 pm please 

CORE: Jennie Enterprise I 
@dandjenterprise I Founder & Chairman 

rote: 
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www.coreaccess.net 

On Mar 2, 2016, at 11:38 A 

Kathy 
will 
come 
on WEd. 
the 
16th 
instead 
...noon 
is still 
good I 
assume 

On Mar 2, 2016 at 8:08 AM Dan ene and Jennie 
Enterprise wrote: 

great ! or thursday 
<EWLarge2jpg> 

CORE: Jennie Enterprise 
@dandjenterprise Founder & 
Chairman I 

www.coreaccess.net 

On Mar 2 2016 at 8:05 AM 
wrote: 

Not sure. Will ask her 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 2, 2016, at 8:02 AM, Dangene and 
Jennie Enterprise 
wrote: 
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Happy Wednesday Lesley ! Can she 
come wed the 16th vs tuesday the 
15th please ? 
<EWLargai pp 

CORE: Jennie Enterprise
@dandjenterprise I 
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www.coreaccess.net 
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