
To: 
From: 
Sent Wed 3/9/2016 7:23:45 PM 
Subject: Re: No BB Refund Check yet? 

Bank of America is showing they mailed it out yesterday for $300. Im not sure 
why it took them longer to process. Let me know if you don't get a check in the 
mail by Friday. 

Thanks! 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Mar 9, 2016, at 7:43 AM, wrote: 

> Hi I still have not rec'd my refund check for paying the ref's the 
last ew games...in the past, the checks came quick—do you think you could check on 
it for me? 

> Thanks, 
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