
To: 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: Re: 

Thur 3/17/2016 4:17:26 PM 

; Bella Klein 

can you please send a better copy to our accounting dept? She can't read them 
well... Bella in our accounting dept is cc'd here...or Bella do you want her to send you hard 
copies in the mail? 

On Mar 17, 2016, at 12:10 PM, Appointment 
wrote: 

Yes, there are two because she purchased two separate packages. 

One for $9,000 plus tax and one for $3,000 plus tax. 

Best, 

: The Institute of Skinovation 
6th Floor 

Between Park & Madison 
South Side of the Street 
New York, NY 10022 

Twitter: 

From: 
Date: Thursday, March 17, 2016 12:09 PM 
To: 
Subject: Re: 

wait...) see another invoice...can you send to me in a separate email? 

On Mar 17, 2016, at 12:04 PM, Appointment 
wrote: 

Hello 

I am sending you the invoice for-

Please let me know if you have any questions. 

Have a great day! 

s package purchases. 
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Best, 

: The Institute of Skinovation 
6th Floor 

Between Park & Madison 
South Side of the Street 
New York, NY 10022 

From: 
Date: Thursday, March 17, 2016 10:20 AM 
To: 
Subject: Ren 

Great. I will call you in about an hour with card number. Thanks! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 17, 2016, at 10:18 AM, Appointment •: ivrote: 

Hi I= 

Happy Thursday! 

I would be more than happy to take care a package for Jeffrey. 

What is the best number I can reach you at to get the credit card he would like us to 
use? 

Many thanks! 

Best, 

Dangene: The Institute of Skinovation 
6th Floor 
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Between Park and Madison 
South Side of the Street 
New York, NY 10022 

From: 
Date: Wednesday, March 16, 2016 at 4:33 PM 
To: 
Cc: J 

Bella Klein 

Subject: Re: 

Jeffrey is paying for  appointment for today! Please do not bill thanks... 

On Mar 16, 2016, at 9:15 AM, 

wrote: 

Good Morning 

Happy Wednesday! 

Yes, we will be seeing 

Have a wonderful day! 

Best, 

today at 1pm. 

Client Experience Manager 

The Institute of Skinovation 
, 6th Floor 

New York, NY 10022 

From: 
Date: Wednesday, March 16, 2016 8:40 AM 
To: 
Cc: 

Reconfirming will come see you today for a facial at 1pm! 
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Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 3, 2016, at 7:14 AM, 

GREAT !!! 
<EWLarge2.jpg> 

CORE: 

Founder & Chairman
New 

York NY 10022 I Main: 
I Mobile: 

On Mar 2, 2016, at 
8:54 PM, 

=wrote: 

has confirmed she will come see you at 1pm on WEd. 
march 16th 

On Mar 2, 2016, at 3:06 PM, 

1 pm 
please 

CORE: 
Founder & Chairman 

New 
York NY 
10022 
Main: 
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On Mar 2, 2016, at 11:38 AM, 

wrote: 

will come on WEd. the 16th instead...noon is 
still good I assume? 

On Mar 2, 2016, at 8:08 AM, 

wrote: 

great ! or thursday 
<EWLarge2.jpg> 

CORE: 
I Founder & 

Chairman I 
New York NY 10022 I Main: 

On Mar 2, 2016, at 8:05 AM, 
wrote: 

Not sure. Will ask her 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 2, 2016, at 8:02 AM, 

wrote: 

Happy Wednesday= ! 
Can she come wed the 16th vs 
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tuesday the 15th please ? 
<EWLarge2jpg> 

CORE: 

Founder & Chairman 

New York NY 10022

<JEFFREY EPSTEIN INVOICE.jpeg><JEFFREY EPSTEIN INVOICE 1.jpeg> 
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